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28 February 2019 
 
Autoworx Plus opens first-ever branch 
 
Promising reliable and quality car care and repair at the best value, Autoworx Plus 
opened its first branch at the Phoenix gas station along West Service Road in 
Muntinlupa City on February 28, 2019.  
 
The car-servicing shop aims to serve motorists as a one-stop automotive facility 
equipped to handle a whole range of car care needs. With dedicated service 
technicians trained and educated in reputable technical schools, Autoworx Plus 
offers light to medium car repairs and maintenance, such as oil change, engine tune-
up, brake servicing, clutch and transmission servicing, under-chassis repair, 
suspension repair, wheel alignment, wheel balancing, tire rotation, bulb and light 
check-up, electrical servicing, vulcanizing, air condition repair, auto detailing, car 
body wash, and under-chassis wash. 
 
The shop also provides a VIP experience to customers with its cozy and spacious 
lounge--an air-conditioned space offering several seats where customers can view 
their vehicle being serviced or browse the Internet while waiting. 

“We want to provide motorists exceptional service and comfort with our range of 
outstanding car-servicing facilities. For further convenience, customers also enjoy 
easy access to complementing products and services found in the gas station and 
convenience store on-site,” Autoworx Plus Business Development Manager Chiqui 
Bagano said. 

Aside from being conveniently located in a Phoenix gas station, Autoworx also 
offers automotive products, and is even equipped with its own FamilyMart outlet 
where customers may purchase food and drinks. Clients can also pay their bills, 
load, or credit card through the Posible digital payment device available at the 
FamilyMart counter. 

Autoworx Plus was established in partnership with Michelin Tires, Denso, Motolite 
Battery, Bendix, Tire Asia, and Alabang Parts Center in providing new and high-
quality car parts, tires and accessories, while service technicians training are 
provided by Don Bosco Technical Institute in Makati and Canlubang. Phoenix 
lubricants are also available for purchase at the shop. 
 
Visit the first Autoworx Plus shop at the Phoenix West Service Road station today! 

 


